BULK FUEL AND LUBRICANTS
BID NO 041414

Canyon State Oil

MV Enterprises

Senergy Petroleum
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BULK FUEL
Globe Shop 52,600 25,750 0.0235 1,236.10 0.0535 1,377.63 2,613.73 0.0800 4,208.00 0.0800 2,060.00 6,268.00 -0.0140 -736.40 0.0700 1,802.50 1,066.10
Courthouse 37,420 0 0.0563 2,106.75 0.0000 0.00 2,106.75 0.1000 3,742.00 0.0000 0.00 3,742.00 0.1150 4,303.30 0.0000 0.00 4,303.30
Tonto Basin Maint. Yard 16,940 10,350 0.0642 1,087.55 0.0942 974.97 2,062.52 0.1500 2,541.00 0.1500 1,552.50 4,093.50 0.2500 4,235.00 0.3200 3,312.00 7,547.00
Payson Maintenance Yard 53,120 41,900 0.0235 1,248.32 0.0535 2,241.65 3,489.97 0.1500 7,968.00 0.1500 6,285.00 14,253.00 0.1650 8,764.80 0.1650 6,913.50 15,678.30
Young Maintenance Yard 5,800 7,000 0.1440 835.20 0.1740 1,218.00 2,053.20 0.3000 1,740.00 0.3000 2,100.00 3,840.00 0.7100 4,118.00 0.3800 2,660.00 6,778.00
AVERAGES 165,880 85,000 0.0623 6,513.91 0.0750 5,812.25 | 12,326.16 0.1560 20,199.00 0.1360 11,997.50 32,196.50 0.2452 20,684.70 0.1870 14,688.00 35,372.70
Estimated Gas & Diesel Cost is the
percentage the vendor proposes to add or
(subtract) from the O.P.1.S. weekly average
rack price, as published every Monday
Western Refining
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BULK FUEL
Globe Shop 52,600 25,750 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00
Courthouse 37,420 0 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00
Tonto Basin Maint. Yard 16,940 10,350 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00
Payson Maintenance Yard 53,120 41,900 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00
Young Maintenance Yard 5,800 7,000 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00
AVERAGES 165,880 85,000 0.0000 0.00 0.0000 0.00 0.00




