Page 1 of 2

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About April 18,2014 12:44:19PMMST O © ¢ H

Homa FOs #ids Contracts Guotss Pailz Horn

| Dvarall Validation Wamings

o S rp fiw ga d
SN SULMIGES.

null

Quote 000027064 - Gila County Health Department

General Iltems Questions Subcontractors Notes Terms & Conditions Attachments Sumimary g Backte
Header Information
Quote #: 000027064 Bid #: ADHS14- Status: In progress
00403830
organization; Arizona Department of Health Services
Description: HRPP-NICP Community Health Delivery 0 Discount 0.0
Nursing Services DayS' Percent:
. . - Shipping As
Bid Flag: Alternate Bid: No Terms: Specified
Freight Terms: Freight Allowed Ship Via Best Way Payment Net 30
Terms: Term:
Promised Date Info Contact: Quote Total $1,665.00
Comment:
Date Last 04/18/2014 12:43:32 PM User last Paula Horn
Updated: Updated:

Vendor accepts the terms & conditions with no exceptions.

ftem information

Print Sequence #1.0: (948 - 65) Regular Home Visit
Quantity UOM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge

1.0 EA $175.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 $175.00 No No

Print Sequence #2.0: (948 - 65) Out of Town Home Visits (All class of visit) Thirty (30) or
more miles from start point of home/office

Quantity UOM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge
1.0 EA $200.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 $200.00 No No

Print Sequence #3.0: (948 - 65) Out of County Home Visits (All class of visits)
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Quantity UOM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid

1.0 EA $200.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 $200.00 No

Print Sequence #4.0: (948 - 65) Interim Local Home Visits

Quantity UOM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid

1.0 EA $100.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 $100.00 No

Print Sequence #5.0: (948 - 65) Shadowing Local Home Visits

Quantity UOM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid

1.0 EA $100.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 $100.00 No
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