

R
A
N
K
I
N
G

BID TABULATION FORM



GILA COUNTY

BID

TITLE:

Aggregate Hauling to Forest Road 512-Young, AZ

BID

DUE

NO:

082213

DATE:

October 2, 2013

TIME: 11:00 AM

	BIDDER FIRM NAME	BID AMOUNT	PER TON PRICE	COMMENTS
1	Otto Trucking	\$391.43/load from Hatch pit \$219.30/load from Tonto pit	1 Load = 25.5 tons 15.35/ton from Hatch pit 8.60/ton from Tonto pit	E-Mod Rating 1.08 Provided cashiers check in lieu of Bid Bond. Truck capacity is 25.5 tons per load.
	Sullivan Paving	Declined to Bid		
3	Dalmolin Excavating	No bid for Hatch pit \$298.00/load from Tonto pit	1 Load = 23 tons no bid from Hatch pit 12.96/ton from Tonto pit	E-Mod Rating .70
	Heritage Trucking	No Bid		
	D J Company, Inc.	No Bid		
	EW Parker Enterprises	\$290.00/load from Hatch pit \$275.00/load from Tonto pit		BID WAS DISQUALIFIED DUE TO LACK OF BID BOND OR CASHIERS CHECK E-Mod Rating .85 Attachment "I" not signed. No Bid Bond or Cashiers Check submitted. 2% per \$.10 increase of fuel surcharge over \$3.60/gallon.
2	Stodghill Excavating, Inc.	\$400.00/load from Hatch pit \$200.00/load from Tonto pit	1 Load = 23 tons 17.39/ton from Hatch pit 8.70/ton from Tonto pit	E-Mod Rating .78 Provided cashiers check in lieu of Bid Bond. Additional charge for standby of \$80.00/hr over 10 minutes at dump or load site. To be billed by the minute.
	Mark's Valley Grading	No Bid		
	Hatch Construction & Paving	No Bid		
	S.A.K.	Declined to Bid		

I hereby certify the above were received prior to the due date and time listed:

Signed

Joanni Sgrot

Printed

JEANNIE SGROT

Date

10-02-13

Signed

Betty S. Hurst

Printed

Betty S. Hurst

Date

10-02-2013