
Chips, ABC Asphalt

Copper Region

Re-Bid 110812-1

April 17, 2013

2:00 P.M.

1/2" Chips 1/2" Chips 3/8" Chips 3/8" Chips ABC-ADOT CL 2 ABC-ADOT CL 2 ABC- MAG ABC- MAG

VENDOR FOB Delivered FOB Delivered FOB Delivered FOB Delivered

Cemex No bid No bid 14.00$              20.25$              9.00$          15.25$        9.00$        15.25$    

Mesa Materials* No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.37$          22.62$        5.37$        22.62$    

  *Additional $5.75 per ton/mile past specified location in RFP 110812-1 Re-Bid

Payson Concrete & Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

MDI Rock No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Pioneer Sand No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Vulcan Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

All Rock Supply, Inc. No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

LaFarge North America No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Paloma Ready Mix & Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Western Aggregates No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Fisher Sand & Rock dba SW Asphalt No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Hawker & Evans Company No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Arizona Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

3/8" Asphalt-MAG 3/8" Asphalt-MAG 3/4" Asphalt-MAG 3/4" Asphalt-MAG

VENDOR FOB Delivered FOB Delivered

Cemex No bid No bid No bid No bid

Mesa Materials* 67.60$              84.60$              64.38$              81.38$              

  *Additional $5.75 per ton/mile past specified location in RFP 110812-1 Re-Bid

Payson Concrete & Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

MDI Rock No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Pioneer Sand No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Vulcan Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

All Rock Supply, Inc. No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

LaFarge North America No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Paloma Ready Mix & Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Western Aggregates No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Fisher Sand & Rock dba SW Asphalt No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Hawker & Evans Company No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Arizona Materials No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid


