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QUOTE TABULATION FORM BID

110812

TITLE: Chips, ABC, Asphalt & Cold Mix for Copper Region and Timber Region

BID DUE

NO.: 110812 DATE: January 16, 2013
BIDDER FIRM NAME BID AMOUNT COMMENTS

Payson Concrete & Materials
pcmexc@gmail.com

SEE BREAKDOWN

emailed IFB 01-02-13 to Dallas.
Called Dallas on 01-04-13 to make
sure he received invite. He had me

928-476-3664 BELOW call Tim Hughes and email it to him
at pcmpsn@gmail.com
MDI Rock
miked@mdirock.com NO BID emailed IFB 01-02-13 to Mike Denny

602-569-8722

Mesa Materials
psouthway@mesamaterials.com

SEE BREAKDOWN

emailed IFB 01-02-13 to Patti

BELOW Southway
602-803-9828
Pioneer Sand
ken@pioneersand.com NO BID emailed IFB 01-02-13 to Ken Ward
602-989-2260
Vulcan Materials
shimerd@vmcmail com NO BID emailed IFB 01-02-13 to Debbie

602-452-5535

Shimer

All Rock Supply, Inc.
Kristen.rodriguez@allrocksupply.net

SEE BREAKDOWN

emailed IFB 01-02-13 to Kristen

BELOW Rodriguez
480-797-6566
LaFarge North America _ .
eric.marshall@lafarge-na.com NO BID emailed IF'\IanOrls—h(;Z”—B to Eric
505-918-4301
Paloma Ready Mix & Materials _
Imb@palomareadymix.com NO BID emailed IFBS;SVi'lS to Loren
602-686-8928
Western Aggregates
bob.mack@westernagg.com NO BID emailed IFB 01-03-13 to Bob Mack
602-291-1588
Fisher Sand & Rock/dba Southwest Asphalt ‘ .
rkissling@fisherind.com NO BID emaled IF8 iils-jisr;gn to Richard
480-730-1033
Cemex _
josel.quintero@cemex.com NO BID emailed IFB 01-03-13 to lose

928-425-5775

Quintero




FW Dodge

emailed IFB 01-04-13 to Ginger at

PUBLICATION )
dodge_reocwe@mcgraw-hill.com McGraw-Hill
Blue Book ,
PUBLICATION entered IFB online 01-04-13
www.thebluebook.com
1/2" Chips
" . . 1400 E. Ash,
BID RESULTS COPPER REGION 1/2" Chips FOB Plant Delivered -
to
Payson Concrete & Materials
4 ! $20.00/ton $29.75/ton
TONTO PLANT
Mesa Materials $13.41/ton $29.66/ton
All Rock Supply $21.50/ton $27.00/ton

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

$.025 per ton/mile from 1400 E. Ash
to final destination

$2.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

3/8" Chips
BID RESULTS COPPER REGION 3/8" Chips FOBPlant | Delivered '*%05 "
to
Payson Concrete & Materials
14. Vi

TONTO PLANT $14.00/ton $33.75/ton

Mesa Materials $13.41/ton $29.66/ton

All Rock Supply $14.50/ton $20.50/ton

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

$.025 per ton/mile from 1400 E. Ash
to final destination

$2.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

ABC-ADOT
ABC-ADOT cl 2
BID RESULTS COPPER REGION FOB Plant -1ass £ 1400E. Ash,
Class 2 Delivered Globe
to
P C te & Material
ayson Concrete aterials $8.50/ton $18.25/ton
TONTO PLANT

Mesa Materials $5.00/ton $21.25/ton
All Rock Supply $15.75/ton $21.50/ton

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

$.025 per ton/mile from 1400 E. Ash
to final destination

$2.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash




ABC-MAG

ABC-MA!
BID RESULTS COPPER REGION CMAG 0B Plant e e
Spec Delivered Globe
to
Payson Concrete & Materials

y $8.50/ton $18.25/ton
TONTO PLANT
Mesa Materials $5.00/ton $21.25/ton
All Rock Supply $15.75/ton $21.50/ton

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

$.025 per ton/mile from 1400 E. Ash
to final destination

$2.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

3/8"
3/8" Asphalt-
1400 E. Ash,
BID RESULTS COPPER REGION Asphalt-  FOBPlant | MAG Spec .~
MAG Spec Delivered
to
P C te & Material
ayson Concrete aterials $63.00/ton $80.50/ton
PAYSON PLANT
Mesa Materials $63.00/ton $80.00/ton
All Rock Supply NO BID NO BID

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

$.025 per ton/mile from 1400 E. Ash
to final destination

$2.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

3/4"
3/4" Asphalt-
1400 E. Ash,
BID RESULTS COPPER REGION Asphalt-  FOBPlant | MAGSpec o .
MAG Spec Delivered
to
P C te & Material
ayson Concrete aterials $61.00/ton $78.50/ton
PAYSON PLANT
Mesa Materials $60.00/ton $77.00/ton
All Rock Supply NO BID NO BID

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

$.025 per ton/mile from 1400 E. Ash
to final destination

$2.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash




Cold Mix-

Cold Mix- Mod 1/2"  1400E. Ash
BID RESULTS COPPER REGION FOB Plant ¢
Mod 1/2" Delivered Globe
to
Payson Concrete & Materials NO BID NO BID
PAYSON PLANT
Mesa Materials $91.20/ton $107.45/ton

All Rock Supply

$115.00/ton

$130.00/ton

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

$.025 per ton/mile from 1400 E. Ash
to final destination

$2.00 per mile beyond 1400 E. Ash

1/2" Chips COBE.H
BID RESULTS TIMBER REGION 1/2" Chips FOBPlant | Delivered =
60, Payson
to
Payson Concrete & Materials
y $25.00/ton $27.00/ton
PAYSON PLANT
Mesa Materials $13.41/ton $29.66/ton
All Rock Supply $21.50/ton $31.50/ton
$7.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy
Delivery Charge 260, Payson

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$.025 per ton/mile from 608 E. Hwy
260 to final destination
$2.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy.

260, Payson
3/8" Chips
n . . 608 E. HWy.
BID RESULTS TIMBER REGION 3/8" Chips FOB Plant Delivered

260, Payson

to
Payson Concrete & Materials

y $19.00/ton $21.00/ton
PAYSON PLANT
Mesa Materials $13.41/ton $29.66/ton
All Rock Supply $14.50/ton $24.50/ton

$7.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy
260, Payson

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$.025 per ton/mile from 608 E. Hwy
260 to final destination
$2.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy.

260, Payson
ABC-ADOT
ABC-ADOT cl 2 . .
BID RESULTS TIMBER REGION FOB Plant -1ass < GOBE. Hwy
Class 2 Delivered 260, Payson
to
Payson Concrete & Materials
13.50/t 15.50/t
PAYSON PLANT »13.50/ton »15.50/ton
Mesa Materials $5.00/ton $21.25/ton
All Rock Supply $15.75/ton $21.50/ton




Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy
260, Payson

$.025 per ton/mile from 608 E. Hwy
260 to final destination
$2.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy.

260, Payson
ABC-MAG
ABC-MAG S . .
BID RESULTS TIMBER REGION FOB Plant | B
Spec Delivered 260, Payson
to
Payson Concrete & Materials
13.50/t 15.50/t
PAYSON PLANT >13.50/ton »15.50/ton
Mesa Materials $5.00/ton $21.25/ton
All Rock Supply $15.75/ton $21.50/ton
$7.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy
Payson Concrete & Materials Delivery Charge 260, Payson

Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$.025 per ton/mile from 608 E. Hwy
260 to final destination
$2.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy.

260, Payson
3/8"
3/8" Asphalt-
608 E. Hwy.
BID RESULTS TIMBER REGION Asphalt- FOB Plant | MAG Spec

260, Payson

MAG Spec Delivered
to
Payson Concrete & Materials
63.00/t 65.50/t
PAYSON PLANT 263.00/ton 265.50/ton
Mesa Materials $63.00/ton $80.00/ton
All Rock Supply NO BID NO BID
$7.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy
Payson Concrete & Materials Delivery Charge 260, Payson

Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$.025 per ton/mile from 608 E. Hwy
260 to final destination
$2.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy.

260, Payson
3/4"
3/4" Asphalt-
608 E. Hwy.
BID RESULTS TIMBER REGION Asphalt- FOB Plant MAG Spec

260, Payson

MAG Spec Delivered
to
Payson Concrete & Materials
61.00/t 63.50/t
PAYSON PLANT >61.00/ton 263.50/ton
Mesa Materials $60.00/ton $77.00/ton
All Rock Supply NO BID NO BID
$7.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy
Payson Concrete & Materials Delivery Charge 260, Payson

Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$.025 per ton/mile from 608 E. Hwy
260 to final destination
$2.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy.
260, Payson




Cold Mix-

Cold Mix- Mod 1/2" 608 E. Hwy.
BID RESULTS TIMBER REGION FOB Plant
Mod 1/2" Delivered 260, Payson
to
P C te & Material
ayson Concrete aterials NO BID NO BID
PAYSON PLANT
Mesa Materials $91.20/ton $107.45/ton

All Rock Supply

$115.00/ton

$130.00/ton

Payson Concrete & Materials
Mesa Materials
All Rock Supply

Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge
Delivery Charge

$7.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy
260, Payson
$.025 per ton/mile from 608 E. Hwy
260 to final destination
$2.00 per mile beyond 608 E. Hwy.
260, Payson







